
Exhibition Coverage

Assembling objects for a major exhibition is a complex, costly and 
time-consuming undertaking. Whether you are a curator arranging 
an exhibition at one venue or an event planner organizing a 
worldwide touring exhibition, we understand the complexities and 
risks associated with this intricate process, such as transit damage 
or damage during installation.

Our exhibition policy is designed to provide insurance protection 
for a wide variety of exhibitions including traditional art, tribal 
collections, technology-based art and historic objects. Our creative 
insurance solutions are crafted to address the concentrations of 
movable property in a single location. Additionally, our policies are 
flexible and can be tailored to the individual needs of your 
organization and to the specifics of each exhibition to avoid costly 
gaps in coverage.

As a member of the Tokio Marine Group, our team of highly 
experienced and knowledgeable underwriters, claims handlers 
and art market experts have built a worldwide reputation on the 
professionalism, availability and responsiveness provided to each 
of our clients. Our global network of professional partners and  
resources allows us to support our clients with all aspects related 
to the protection of their valuable and often delicate objects in 
public spaces, as well as the challenges of transporting owned and 
loaned objects worldwide.

Why Entrust Us with Your Exhibition Insurance Needs?

What You Can Expect

Policy Highlights

•	 Flexible terms by day, month and year

•	 Minimum premium: $1,000

•	 Multi-year policies available

•	 “Nail-to-Nail” and “Wall-to-Wall” coverage

•	 No policy deductible requirements, deductibles 		
	 options are available for rate credits

•	 Objects are insured at “agreed value” and exhibitry 	
	 at actual “cash value” or “replacement value”

•	 Traveling exhibitions including multi-venue 
	 exhibitions

•	 Worldwide coverage
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